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ABSTRACT 

The use of acid-boron trifluoride complexes has been 
found to be a convenient general method for the prepara­
tion of phenolic ketones and phenyl styryl ketones. Re­
sorcinol and pyrogallol react with boron trifluoride-acetic 
acid complex at room temperature, giving resacetophe­
none and gallacetophenone in 80-90 percent yield. 2,6-
Dimethoxy hydroquinone and antiarol (3,4,5-tri­
methoxyphenol), when dissolved in boron trifluoride-ace­
tic acid complex and poured into ice after leaving over­
night at room temperature, give the corresponding aceto­
phenones in 60-70 percent yield. With 2-napththol, a 
boron trifluoride complex of the ketone is first obtained 
and boiling with water for a few minutes gives l-acetyl-2-
naphthol in 93 percent yield. When cinnamic acid dis­
solved in chloroform is saturated with boron trifluoride, 
resorcinol added, and the solution left overnight at room 
temperature, 2,4-dihydroxyphenyl styryl ketone is ob-

tained in 70 percent yield. Pyrogallol under similar condi­
tions gives an 80 percent yield of the corresponding phenyl 
styryl ketone. Both 2,6-dimethoxyhydroquinone and anti­
arol condense readily with the boron trifluoride complex of 
cinnamic acid to give2,5-dihydroxy-4,6-dimethoxyphenyl, 
and 2-hydroxy-4,5,6-trimethoxyphenyl styryl ketone re­
spectively. 

Boron trifluoride and its derivatives have been used as 
catalysts in condensations and rearrangements during the 
past century since the commercial production of boron 
trifluoride by the Harshaw Chemical Company in 1936 
made it readily available. The use of boron trifluoride 
complexes for the synthesis of phenolic ketones, phenyl 
styryl ketones and otherphenolics is of more recent date and 
has been the subject of extensive investigation in the 
present work. 

Phenolic ketones and phenyl styryl ketones are neces­
sary intermediates for the synthesis of flavonoid com-
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